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Packard, Harvey@Waterboards

From: Miss Coleman <cintheatcoleman@gmail.com>
Sent: Sunday, August 31, 2014 3:02 PM
To: Harris, Ken@Waterboards; Packard, Harvey@Waterboards
Cc: Miss Coleman; bgibson@co.slo.ca.us
Subject: Re: Amended Demand for Payment

The 30 days allowed for payment to me of the $25,000.00 I spent to be 
compliant with CDO #1002 has passed with no response from you 
(CCRWQCB). 
That's disappointing. 
Now, I hear you (CCRWQCB) will systematically rescind all the 
remaining CDO's at your meeting later in September. 
Here's how I see it: 
I received Draft CDO #1002 after it was signed for by someone not living 
here. 
It demanded I provide personal information within 5 days or fines of 
$1,000.00 a day would start. 
It was signed by Roger W Briggs. 
No one has the Authority to demand this, nor to threaten fines for non-
compliance. 
It also demanded I should pump my septic EVERY 2 months. Now, you 
(CCRWQCB) finally admit you have no Authority to demand septic 
pumping every 3 YEARS. 
CDO #1002 arrived after "hearings" where I was found "guilty" because I 
live here (and, presumably, use my septic system "in violation of the Basin 
Plan/83-13") 
If I didn't comply, (by not putting even 1 drop of clean water into my 
septic) I'd be fined $5,000.00 a day..(over $35 MILLION now) 
It was signed by Gerhard Hubner "for Roger W Briggs" 
I was able to be compliant. 
No one cared and I've been ignored for 7 years because you 
(CCRWQCB/Harvey Packard) continued to tell me, "you're compliant as 
long as the County works on the sewer". 
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I believe you (CCRWQCB) don't have much Authority at all. 
I believe it's all been Bullying/Extortion to get this sewer in, although, in 
my opinion, it won't ever work and there's no way to force us to stop using 
our septics on our Private Property and/or hook up & use the sewer. 
I've said repeatedly, ad nauseum, that I can't afford to hook up, ($5-12K) 
nor the $hundreds a month to use it.  
But, no one cares about that, me or any of my Rights that are long gone, 
thanks to you (CCRWQCB) and your pals at SLO County. 
I haven't given up on somebody wanting to help, even though it's Local, 
County, State and Federal Governments against me. 
Miss Cinthea T Coleman 
 
 

On Sun, Jul 27, 2014 at 12:31 PM, Miss Coleman <cintheatcoleman@gmail.com> wrote: 

 
This is a Demand for Payment by Miss Cinthea T Coleman, 
property owner, senior, single for $25,000.00 from the Central 
Coast Regional Water Control Board. 
Eight years ago, I was given Cease and Desist Order #1002 by 
CCRWQCB Board of Directors for using the septic system on the 
property I own at 1399 14th Street, Baywood Park and for this 
Reason only. 
It threatened fines of "$5,000.00 a day" for every day I continued to use said septic in 
violation of "83-13", "the Basin Plan" and/or "the Basin Prohibition""Moratorium".  

To date, this totals around $35 Million. 
Thus 

,  
I had two choices:  
Stop using the septic system or be fined.  
A third choice of compliance was  

later  
offered "as long as the county  works on the sewer" but this was not a viable choice 
because: 
1. I have no control over the county regarding sewer work. 
2. This sewer project has been ongoing for some 30 years and is not now finished. 
3.  Until the project is actually in operation, then and only then can the septic 
systems  be in compliance. 
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I chose to comply with CDO #1002 by implementing my "System for 
Compliance". 
It cost $25,000.00 and allows me to  
not only  
eliminate the use of the septic  
but 
 the need for hooking up to a sewer 
 as well 
. 
All plans, receipts and results were submitted with no  
response or support of any kind 
. 
I was able to be "compliant" with the Cease and Desist Order 7 
years ago. 
To force me to comply by ANY other method is unacceptable and, 
quite possibly, illegal. 
In accordance with the Law, you (CCRWQCB) have 30 days to 
comply with me, for a Change, and remit $25,000.00. 
All documentation and Evidence is archived @ CCRWQCB and 
available from me by request, with no charge. 
Sincerely, 
Miss Cinthea T Coleman 
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