
TABLE 1 
401 WATER QUALITY CERTIFICATION APPLICATIONS 

Received October 15, 2018 – December 5, 2018 

Applicant Date 
Received Project Title Project Purpose Location County Receiving 

Water 

Pro- 
posed 
Total 

Impact1 
Status 

Carmel Area Water 
District- Patrick 

Treanor 
10/22/2018 

Hatton 
Canyon Sewer 

Main 
Replacement 

To replace the deteriorated sewer 
main, reduce the risk of future 

sanitary sewer overflow, reduce 
inflow and infiltration rates, and 

simplify maintenance. 

Un-
incorporated 

Monterey 
Co. 

Monterey 
Hatton 
Canyon 
Stream 

0.05 
acres/ 637 
linear feet 

Under Staff 
Review 

Caltrans- Randy 
LaVack 10/24/2018 MON-1-24.76 

Culvert Repair 

To replace and rehabilitate a 
corroded corrugated metal pipe 

and flare end section. 
Big Sur Monterey 

Unnamed 
ephemeral 
drainage 

0.03 
acres/ 338 
linear feet 

Under Staff 
Review 

City of Santa Cruz- 
Jon Bombaci 10/25/2018 

Santa Cruz 
Wharf 

Maintenance 

To ensure the safety and public 
accessibility of the Wharf by 

conducting maintenance 
activities. 

Santa Cruz Santa 
Cruz 

Monterey 
Bay 

0.0032 
acres 

Under Staff 
Review 

Monterey County 
Regional Fire District- 

David Sargenti 
10/29/2018 

El Toro Creek 
Bank 

Armoring 

To install a riprap feature to stop 
ongoing bank erosion, restore the 

creek bank, and prevent the 
undermining of the root structure 

of three oak trees. 

Former Fort 
Ord Monterey El Toro 

Creek 

0.04 
acres/ 150 
linear feet 

Under Staff 
Review 

Santa Cruz County 
Regional 

Transportation 
Commission- George 

Dondero 

10/31/2018 

Santa Cruz 
Branch Rail 
Line Storm 
Damage 
Repairs 

To rebuild a storm damaged 
portion of the Santa Cruz Branch 
Rail line near Gallighan Slough by 

replacing two existing plugged 
drainage structures with precast 

concrete box culverts. 

Watsonville Santa 
Cruz 

Unnamed 
tributaries to 

Gallighan 
Slough 

0.0156 
acres/ 340 
linear feet 

Under Staff 
Review 

The Partnership for 
Resilient 

Communities- Pat 
McElroy 

11/2/2018 
Montecito 

Debris Flow 
Mitigation 

To install 15 Geobrugg flexible 
debris flow nets to mitigate future 

damage to watersheds of 
Montecito. 

Montecito Santa 
Barbara 

Cold Spring, 
Hot Springs, 
San Ysidro, 
Buena Vista, 
and Romero 

Creeks 

7.2 acres Under Staff 
Review 

1 / 2 Item No. 18 Attachment 1 
January 31, February 1, 2019 

Table 1 - 401 Water Quality Certification Applications Received



Applicant Date 
Received Project Title Project Purpose Location County Receiving 

Water 

Pro- 
posed 
Total 

Impact1 
Status 

Moss Landing Marine 
Labs- Kathleen 

Donahue 
11/14/2018 

Moss Landing 
Marine Labs 

Del Mar Wharf 
Demo 

To demolish a 1,200 sq. ft. 
building and concrete slab 

located on the wharf property. 

Moss 
Landing Monterey 

Moss 
Landing 
Harbor 

55 linear 
feet 

Incomplete 
Application 

Department of the 
Navy- Victoria Taber 11/15/2018 

NSA Monterey 
Lake Del 

Monte 
Sediment and 

Vegetation 
Removal 

To remove accumulated 
sediments that are blocking 

inflows and the outflow of Lake 
Del Monte. 

Monterey Monterey Del Monte 
Lake 2.07 acres Under Staff 

Review 

Hecker Pass North, 
LLC- Skip Spiering 11/20/2018 

Hecker Pass 
North Cluster 

(Hoey) 

To preserve the on-site drainage 
through the property and improve 

conditions relative to riparian 
cover, flood flow conveyance, and 

water quality. 

Gilroy Santa 
Clara Uvas Creek 

0.09 
acres/ 

71.5 linear 
feet 

Under Staff 
Review 

 [1] Total Impact includes both temporary and permanent impacts to waters. 
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